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RE: FW: Payment - Thank You

Subject: RE: FW: Payment - Thank You
From: Frank Kustura <frank@gulfcoastmedia.com>
Date: 7/17/25, 16:20
To: Howell Gibbens <gibbens@me.com>

Ha, btw, | do like the message in your ad-

Frank

From: Howell Gibbens <gibbens@me.com>
Sent: Thursday, July 17, 2025 4:17 PM

To: Frank Kustura <frank@gulfcoastmedia.com>
Subject: Re: FW: Payment - Thank You

You were able to get him off the phone, I'm impressed!

Attached find the artwork.

Howell

On 7/17/25 16:15, Frank Kustura wrote:

Einar called me with payment for your ad, please see receipt below.

I've also attached a corrected invoice to show the correct spelling of your name.

Thank you and best wishes with your campaign!

Frank

From: thesumteritem <thesumteritem@theitem.com>
Sent: Thursday, July 17, 2025 3:07 PM
To: Frank Kustura <frank@gulfcoastmedia.com>

Subject: Payment - Thank You

Gulf Coast Media - Howell Gibbens for Fairhope City Council Place 4 #1006281 Thank you.

R

e ¢c e i p t

The Sumter Item / Osteen Publishing Co.

PO Box 1677
Sumter, SC 29151
Ph. 803-774-1236

Customer # 1006281
Date 07/17/2025
Total Paid 699.00
Ad Number |Description Transaction Id Am(l),glil;
0 GULF COAST 276820250717150627214172| 699.00
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